



Thursday, October 25, 2018

2019 Chemical Bid Tabulation Sheet
for the City of Longview and City of Kelso

BIDDER	BID ITEM 1	BID ITEM 2	BID ITEM 3	BID ITEM 4
(Shaded Area = Recommended Award)	<u>Sodium Fluoride</u>	<u>Flourosilicic Acid</u>	<u>Sodium Hydroxide</u>	<u>Sodium Hypochlorite</u>
	(\$ / lb)	(\$ / gal)	(\$ / gal)	(\$ / gal)
Olin	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Cascade Columbia	\$1.1100	\$3.2000	\$1.1000	\$1.1850
HASA	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.8700
JCI Jones	no bid	no bid	\$1.0200	\$0.8300
Univar	\$0.9000	\$3.8600	\$0.9776	no bid
Northstar Chemical	no bid	no bid	\$0.9700	no bid

City of Longview Chemical Purchase Comparison, 2018 vs. 2019										
Item	Bid Units	Longview Bid Quantities			Bid Award Unit Prices			Estimated Cost		
		2018	2019	Quantity Change	2018	2019	Unit Price Change	2018	2019	Cost Change
<u>Flourosilicic Acid</u>	Gallons	4,500	4,500	0	\$3.200	\$3.200	\$0.000	\$14,400	\$14,400	\$0
<u>Sodium Hydroxide</u>	Gallons	50,000	50,000	0	\$0.920	\$0.9700	\$0.050	\$46,000	\$48,500	\$2,500
<u>Sodium Hypochlorite</u>	Gallons	73,000	73,000	0	\$0.760	\$0.870	\$0.110	\$55,480	\$63,510	\$8,030
Estimated Total Change:									\$10,530	