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2017 Chemical Bid Tabulation Sheet
for the City of Longview and City of Kelso

BIDDER BID ITEM 1 BID ITEM 2 BID ITEM 3 BID ITEM 4
(Shaded Area = Sodium Fluoride Elourosilicic Acid Sodium Hydroxide |Sodium Hypochlorite
Recommended Award)

($/1b) ($/gal) ($/gal) ($/gal)
Univar $1.1420 No Bid $1.0627 No Bid
Brenntagg $0.8500 No Bid $0.9300 No Bid
HASA No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.7250
JCI Jones No Bid No Bid $0.7700 No Bid
Cascade Columbia $0.7200 $3.1800 No Bid No Bid
Sierra $0.8400 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Northstar No Bid No Bid $0.7088 No Bid

Wednesday, October 19, 2016

City of Longview Chemical Purchase Comparison, 2016 vs. 2017

Longview Bid Quantities Bid Award Unit Prices Estimated Cost
Item Bid Units
2016 2017 Quantity Change 2016 2017 Unit Price Change 2016 2017 Cost Change
Elourosilicic Acid Gallons 4,500 4,500 0 $3.510 $3.180 ($0.330) $15,795 $14,310 -$1,485
) )

Sodium Hydroxide Gallons 50,000 50,000 0 $0.695 $0.7088 $0.014 $34,750 $35,440 $690
Sodium Hypochlorite Gallons 73,000 73,000 0 $0.590 $0.725 $0.135 $43,070 $52,925 $9,855
Estimated Total Change $9,060)




